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This book provides an accessible, broad and up-to-date overview of alternating current (AC) power systems.
The focus of the chapters is on the structure, functioning, and organization of the power system. New to the
second edition is coverage of the steady-state modelling of the power system components (including
symmetrical components), covered in a new appendix. There are thorough updates to Chapters 7 - on
electricity markets – and 8, on the future of power systems, with topical information on smart grids. There is
a brand new chapter on grounding, protection and system faults, and new exercises in every chapter (with
solutions in the appendix), aiding readers in their understanding of the material introduced. Written in a clear
style, the first edition has established itself as one of the best books for introducing the subjects surrounding
electrical power systems. With an original approach it covers new and advanced topic such as FACTS
devices, Maxwell, transformer inrush, and topics from power electronics (e.g. voltage source converter, (gate
turn-off) thyristors, pulse-width modulation) and high voltage engineering (e.g. insulation, corona, lightning,
electric field strength). Throughout the book there are examples and case studies that back up the theory or
techniques presented. The authors set out information on mathematical modelling and equations in
appendices, rather than integrated in a potentially confusing way in the text, in order to make the text
accessible for undergraduate students and readers without a technical background directly related to power
engineering.
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From reader reviews:

Tanisha Goss:

Do you have favorite book? Should you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for
us to find out everything in the world. Each guide has different aim as well as goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people truly feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. They are really
reading whatever they acquire because their hobby will be reading a book. What about the person who don't
like reading through a book? Sometime, man feel need book when they found difficult problem or even
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Electrical Power System Essentials.

Janet Steele:

As people who live in often the modest era should be change about what going on or information even
knowledge to make these keep up with the era which can be always change and make progress. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice for you but the problems coming to
you actually is you don't know which you should start with. This Electrical Power System Essentials is our
recommendation so you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and need in this
era.

Russell Pittman:

As a university student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library
or to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's internal or
real their passion. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to presently
there but nothing reading seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as
can't see colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As
we know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says,
ways to reach Chinese's country. Therefore this Electrical Power System Essentials can make you experience
more interested to read.

Stacy Abercrombie:

What is your hobby? Have you heard that will question when you got pupils? We believe that that question
was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every individual has different hobby. Therefore
you know that little person similar to reading or as examining become their hobby. You have to know that
reading is very important along with book as to be the factor. Book is important thing to add you knowledge,
except your current teacher or lecturer. You see good news or update concerning something by book. Many
kinds of books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is niagra Electrical Power System
Essentials.
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