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You Matter: Dealing with Life's Challenges and Choices is a phenomenal tool to empower young adults.
This guide helps readers proactively cope with the challenges life will inevitably throw their way. Top
American educator and CEO Dr. Bill Maynard captures what makes the difference in, a rewarding self-help
adventure guide for young adults. Candid, eye opening, and truly inspired, this upbeat, hands-on series of
lessons is based on the author's wildly popular course at Washington State University's College of Business.
In eight engaging chapters with titles like "Who Are You Really," "Raising Your Parents," and "Being in
Love and Breaking Up," students themselves and Maynard tell it like it is-and how it could be. His primary
goal is to ignite readers' passions as well as their problem-solving skills. He wants young people to know that
they're not alone; everyone has challenges, it's a matter of taking charge and applying one's talents and
abilities that makes the difference between mere survival and definitive success. Each fully annotated chapter
features clever self-assessment tools and "Key Takeaways" that outline what's not to be missed. Filled with
real-life stories, Maynard guides readers along practical pathways through experience-based learning
applications. He makes a point to cover real-life issues such as depression, sex, betrayal, and the death of
loved ones, because it is certain that the future will hold challenges for each and every one of us. Maynard,
it's about empowerment, and it's about becoming keenly aware of the fact that bad stuff is bound to happen.
When tough times hit, what matters is that who and what we are counts, because make no mistake-life is
what we make it!
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From reader reviews:

Steven Campbell:

This You Matter book is just not ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit you
will get by reading this book is definitely information inside this book incredible fresh, you will get facts
which is getting deeper you read a lot of information you will get. This particular You Matter without we
understand teach the one who reading through it become critical in thinking and analyzing. Don't become
worry You Matter can bring when you are and not make your bag space or bookshelves' become full because
you can have it in your lovely laptop even mobile phone. This You Matter having very good arrangement in
word as well as layout, so you will not feel uninterested in reading.

Anna Lewis:

Now a day folks who Living in the era everywhere everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each information they get. How a lot
more to be smart in receiving any information nowadays? Of course the solution is reading a book. Reading
a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information specifically this You Matter book as this book
offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no
doubt in it as you know.

Mary Redus:

Many people spending their time frame by playing outside along with friends, fun activity having family or
just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading through a
book. Ugh, do you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to accept the book everywhere? It
alright you can have the e-book, having everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like You Matter which
is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Donald Lester:

As a scholar exactly feel bored to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in order to
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just very little students that has reading's spirit or real
their leisure activity. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally
there but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as
can't see colorful photographs on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important for you. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore , this You Matter can make you really feel more interested to read.
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