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“Isabel Vincent has written a riveting account of the life of the international socialite and billionairess Lily
Safra, allegedly the third richest woman in the world.... It’s a very good read.” — Dominick Dunne

In this absorbing biography of Brazilian-born philanthropist and socialite Lily Safra—the first ever
published—acclaimed investigative journalist Isabel Vincent (Bodies and Souls) delves beneath the intrigue
surrounding one of the world’s richest women. From her humble beginnings in a Rio de Janeiro shantytown
to the tragic death of her fourth husband, legendary billionaire banker Edmond Safra, in an arsonist’s fire in
their Monte Carlo penthouse, Gilded Lily combines all the elements of compelling fiction in an absolutely
enthralling account.
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From reader reviews:

Ana Jara:

The book Gilded Lily: Lily Safra: The Making of One of the World's Wealthiest Widows will bring you to
definitely the new experience of reading a book. The author style to explain the idea is very unique. If you
try to find new book to study, this book very suitable to you. The book Gilded Lily: Lily Safra: The Making
of One of the World's Wealthiest Widows is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-
book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

Anthony Wood:

The book untitled Gilded Lily: Lily Safra: The Making of One of the World's Wealthiest Widows contain a
lot of information on the item. The writer explains the woman idea with easy way. The language is very easy
to understand all the people, so do not necessarily worry, you can easy to read the item. The book was
published by famous author. The author will take you in the new time of literary works. You can easily read
this book because you can please read on your smart phone, or model, so you can read the book in anywhere
and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can open their official web-site along with order it. Have a
nice read.

Ronald Stauffer:

You can spend your free time to learn this book this book. This Gilded Lily: Lily Safra: The Making of One
of the World's Wealthiest Widows is simple to develop you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach,
train as well as soon. If you did not include much space to bring typically the printed book, you can buy the
actual e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. And so
there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.

Karl Irwin:

Is it you actually who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day simply by watching television
programs or just lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Gilded Lily: Lily Safra: The
Making of One of the World's Wealthiest Widows can be the answer, oh how comes? It's a book you know.
You are therefore out of date, spending your spare time by reading in this completely new era is common not
a geek activity. So what these books have than the others?
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