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This is the first book-length study in English of the work of Eugenio Montale, who is probably the greatest
living Italian poet. Montale is complex and difficult, but interest in his poetry is increasing among English-
speaking scholars and readers, and this study will contribute substantially to an understanding and
appreciation of it. Professor Pipa focuses his examination on the influence which Dante's poetry has had on
Montale's work. Montale has been called "Dantesque" by some critics for his frequent use of Dantean
language and for certain affinities with the Florentine poet. By his reading of Montale "through the lens of
Dante," as he describes his method, Professor Pipa finds that Dante has been to Montale not merely a
linguistic or literary model but a poetic ideal to emulate. Professor Pipa provides a complete bibliography of
poetry, prose, and translations by Montale and lists the most important critical and biographical monographs
and articles about him. A bilingual appendix includes five prose selections by Montale, published for the first
time in English translation. Montale's poetry has appeared in three slim volumes: Ossi di seppia (Cuttlefish
Bones), Le Occasioni (The Occasions), and La Bufera e altro (The Storm and Something Else) published in
1925, 1939, and 1956 respectively. His prose work, La Farfalla di Dinard (The Butterfly of Dinard), includes
autobiographical short stories. Montale is also a critic of literature and music. This is Volume 4, Minnesota
Monographs in the Humanities, of which Gerhard H, Weiss is the series editor.
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From reader reviews:

Roy Brown:

Do you have favorite book? When you have, what is your favorite's book? Reserve is very important thing
for us to know everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or goal; it means that publication
has different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their a chance to read a book. These are reading whatever
they acquire because their hobby is usually reading a book. Think about the person who don't like reading a
book? Sometime, particular person feel need book when they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you'll have this Montale and Dante.

Mary Manzo:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or maybe go to the outside with them
family or their friend. Do you know? Many a lot of people spent these people free time just watching TV, or
perhaps playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity this is look different you
can read the book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book which you read you can spent the whole day
to reading a book. The book Montale and Dante it is very good to read. There are a lot of people who
recommended this book. These people were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough
space to bring this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this book from your
smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book provides high quality.

James Oliver:

This Montale and Dante is great guide for you because the content that is certainly full of information for
you who also always deal with world and have to make decision every minute. That book reveal it details
accurately using great coordinate word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read
that hurriedly you can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but
challenging core information with attractive delivering sentences. Having Montale and Dante in your hand
like keeping the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous one. We can say that no e-book that offer you
world within ten or fifteen small right but this publication already do that. So , this is good reading book.
Heya Mr. and Mrs. hectic do you still doubt this?

Elizabeth Hart:

A lot of people said that they feel weary when they reading a reserve. They are directly felt it when they get a
half portions of the book. You can choose typically the book Montale and Dante to make your reading is
interesting. Your own skill of reading ability is developing when you like reading. Try to choose very simple
book to make you enjoy to study it and mingle the impression about book and studying especially. It is to be
initial opinion for you to like to start a book and read it. Beside that the publication Montale and Dante can to
be your brand new friend when you're truly feel alone and confuse using what must you're doing of this time.
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